
                                 2024 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 4

Ckky&fookg izfr"ks/k ¼fgekpy izns’k la’kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2024

¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfIkr :i esa ½



Ckky&fookg izfr"ks/k ¼fgekpy izns’k la’kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2024

[k.Mksa dk Øe

[k.M%

1- laf{kIr uke] ykxw gksuk vkSj izkjEHkA
2- /kkjk 2 dk la”kks/kuA
3- /kkjk 3 dk la”kks/kuA
4- /kkjk 18&d dk var%LFkkiuA
5- dfri; vf/kfu;fefr;ksa dk la”kks/kuA



Ckky&fookg izfr"ks/k ¼fgekpy izns’k la’kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2024

¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfIkr :i esa½

fgekpy izns”k jkT; dks ykxw Ckky&fookg izfr’ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006
¼2007 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 6½ dk la”kks/ku djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds ipgRrjosa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk }kjk
fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g vf/kfu;fer gks %&

1- ¼1½ bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke Ckky&fookg izfr’ks/k ¼fgekpy
izns'k la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2024 gSA

¼2½ Hkkjrh; fØf”p;u fookg vf/kfu;e] 1872( ikjlh fookg vkSj
fookg foPNsn vf/kfu;e] 1936( eqfLye Loh; fof?k ¼”kjh;r½ vf/kfu;e] 1937(
fo”ks’k fookg vf/kfu;e] 1954( fgUnw fookg vf/kfu;e] 1955( ;k fookg ds lacèk
esa viukbZ tk jgh fdlh fof/k ;k izFkk ;k :f<+ ;k O;ogkj  ;k rRle; izo`Ÿk
fdlh vU; fof/k esa fufgr fdlh ckr ds izfrdwy ;k mlds vlaaxr gksrs gq, Hkh
;g fgekpy izns”k ds jkT; {ks= esa vf/kokflr lHkh O;fDr;ksa ij ykxw gksxkA

¼3½ bl vf/kfu;e dh ;g /kkjk] /kkjk 2 ds [k.M ¼ii½ vkSj /kkjk 4
rqjUr izHkko ls izo`Ÿk gksaxh vkSj “ks’k micU/k muds vf/kfu;eu dh rkjh[k ls nks
o’kZ ds lekiu dh rkjh[k ls izo`Ÿk gksaxs rFkk bl vf/kfu;e ds izkjaHk ds lacaèk
esa ,sls fdlh mica/k esa fdlh lanHkZ dk vFkZ ml mica/k ds izo`Ÿk gksus ds lanHkZ
esa yxk;k tk,xkA

2- Ckky&fookg izfr’ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006 ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~
ßewy vf/kfu;eÞ dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 2 esa]&

¼i½ [k.M ¼d½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[kk tk,xk]
vFkkZr~%&

ß¼d½ Þckydß ls] ,slk iq#’k ;k ukjh vfHkizsr gS] ftlus
bDdhl o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ugha dh gS]ß(

2024 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 4

laf{kIr uke]
ykxw gksuk vkSj
izkjEHkA

/kkjk 2 dk
la”kks/kuA

10

15

20

15 of 1872

3 of 1936

26 of 1937

43 of 1954
25 of 1955



¼ii½ [k.M ¼[k½ esa Þnksuksa i{kdkjksa esa lsÞ “kCnksa ds i”pkr~
^^]i{kdkjksa dks “kkflr djus okyh fdlh izFkk ;k :f<+ ;k
O;ogkj lfgr rRle; izo`Ÿk fdlh vU; fof/k esa vUrÆo’V
fdlh ckr ds izfrdwy ;k vlaxr gksrs gq, Hkh]Þ “kCn vkSj
fpUg vUr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA

3- ßewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3 dh mi/kkjk ¼3½ esa]& Þnks o’kZß “kCnksa
ds LFkku ij Þikap o’kZß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA

4- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 18&d ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr /kkjk
var%LFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%&

Þ18&d- vf/kfu;e dk v/;kjksgh izHkko gksuk-&bl vfèkfu;e
ds micU/kksa dk] i{kdkjksa dks “kkflr djus okyh fdlh izFkk ;k
:f<+ ;k O;ogkj lfgr rRle; izo`Ÿk fdlh vU; fof/k esa
vUrÆo’V fdlh ckr ds izfrdwy ;k vlaxr gksrs gq, Hkh izHkko
gksxkAßA

5- vuqlwph esa fofuÆn’V vf/kfu;fefr;ksa dk muesa oÆ.kr jhfr esa
la”kksèku fd;k tk,xkA

/kkjk 3 dk
la”kks/kuA

/kkjk 18&d
dk

var%LFkkiuA

dfri;
vfèkfu;fefr;ksa
dk la”kks/kuA

5

10

15

2



vuqlwph
¼/kkjk 5 ns[ksa½

Øe la[;k o"kZ vf/kfu;e laf{kIr uke la”kks/ku
la[;k

¼1½ ¼2½ ¼3½ ¼4½ ¼5½

1- 1872 15 Hkkjrh; fØf”p;u
fookg vf/kfu;e]
1872

2- 1936 3 ikjlh fookg vkSj
fookg&foPNsn
vf/kfu;e] 1936

3- 1954 43 fo'ks"k fookg
vf/kfu;e] 1954

4- 1955 25 fgUnw fookg
vf/kfu;e] 1955

/kkjk 60 ds  [k.M ¼1½ ds LFkku ij
fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%&

Þ¼1½  fookg dk vk”k; j[kus okys iq:’k
vkSj L=h dh vk;q bDdhl o’kZ ls
de ugha gksxh(ß(

¼d½ /kkjk 3 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds [k.M
¼x½ esa Þog efgyk gS rks] vBkjg
o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ugha dh gSÞ “kCnksa
ds LFkku ij Þog efgyk gS rks]
bDdhl o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ugha dh
gSß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA

¼[k½ f}rh; vuqlwph esa] ß;fn fookg ds
i{kdkj 21 o’kZ ls de vk;q ds gSa
rks muds firk ;k laj{kd ds gLrk{kjß
in dk yksi fd;k tk,xkA

/kkjk 4 ds [k.M ¼x½ esa ÞvBkjg o’kZß
“kCnksa ds LFkku ij ÞbDdhl o’kZß “kCn j[ks
tk,axsA

¼d½ /kkjk 5 ds [k.M ¼iii½ esa ÞvBkjg
o’kZß “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ÞbDdhl
o’kZß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA

¼[k½ /kkjk 13 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ ds [k.M
¼iv½ esa ÞvBkjg o’kZß “kCnksa ds LFkku
ij ÞbDdhl o’kZß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA

3



mÌs’;ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku

cky fookg izfr"ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006 dks cky fookg vuq"Bku lEiUu djkus vkSj rRlac) ;k

mlds vkuq"kafxd ekeyksa dks izfrf"k) djus ds fy, micaf/kr djus gsrq vf/kfu;fer fd;k x;k FkkA

vk/kqfud ;qx esa efgyk,a izR;sd {ks= esa izxfr dj jgh gSaA rFkkfi] cky fookg u dsoy muds O;olk;

dh izxfr esa cfYd muds 'kkjhfjd fodkl esa Hkh ck/kd gSA ySafxd lekurk vkSj mPpÙkj f'k{kk izkIr

djus ds voljksa ds fy, mica/k djus gsrq ckfydkvksa ds fy, fookg dh U;wure vk;q esa o`f) djuk

vko';d gks x;k gSA bl izdkj] fgekpy izns'k jkT; esa ykxw cky fookg izfr"ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006

vkSj vU; lacaf/kr vf/kfu;eksa esa la'kks/ku fd;k tkuk rFkk ckfydkvksa ds fy, fookg gsrq U;wure vk;q

dks 21 o"kZ djuk izLrkfor fd;k x;k gSA

;g fo/ks;d mi;qZDr mÌs”;ksa dh iwfrZ ds fy, gSA

¼Mk0 ¼duZy½ /kuh jke 'kkafMy½
izHkkjh ea=hA

f”keyk%
rkjh[k% -------------------------] 2024

&&&&&&&&

foŸkh; Kkiu

&”kwU;&

&&&&&&&&

izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu

&”kwU;&



Ckky&fookg izfr"ks/k ¼fgekpy izns’k la’kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2024

fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ykxw Ckky&fookg izfr’ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006 ¼2007 dk vf/kfu;e
la[;kad 6½ dk vkSj la”kks/ku djus dss fy, fo/ks;dA

 ¼Mk0 ¼duZy½ /kuh jke 'kkafMy½
izHkkjh ea=hA

&&&&&&&

¼’kjn dqekj yxoky½
         Lfpo ¼fof/k½A

f”keyk%

rkjh[k% ---------------------------------------] 2024



bl la'kks/ku fo/ks;d }kjk lEHkkO; izHkkfor gksus okys cky&fookg izfr"ks/k vf/kfu;e]
2006 ¼2007 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 6½ ds mica/kksa ds m)j.kA

/kkjk,a%&

2- ifjHkk"kk,a-&bl vf/kfu;e esa] tc rd fd lanHkZ ls vU;Fkk u gks]&

¼d½ Þckydß ls ,slk O;fDr vfHkizsr gS ftlus] ;fn iq#’k gS rks] bDdhl o’kZ dh vk;q
iwjh ughsa dh gS vkSj ;fn ukjh gS rks] vBkjg o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ughsa dh gS(

¼[k½ Þcky&fookgß ls ,slk fookg vfHkizsr gS ftlds ca/ku esa vkus okys nksuksa i{kdkjksa
esa ls dksbZ ckyd gS(

¼x½ fookg ds laca/k esa ßca/ku essa vkus okys i{kdkjÞ ls i{kdkjksa esa ls dksbZ Hkh ,slk
i{kdkj vfHkizsr gS ftldk fookg mlds }kjk vuq’Bkfir fd;k tkrk gS ;k fd;k
tkus okyk gS(

¼?k½ Þcky&fookg izfr’ks/k vf/kdkjhß ds vUrxZr /kkjk 16 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu
fu;qDr Þcky&fookg izfr’ks/k Hkh gS(

¼³½ ßftyk U;k;ky;Þ ls vfHkizsr gS ,sls {ks= esa] tgka dqVaqc U;k;ky; vf/kfu;e]
1984 ¼1984 dk 66½ dh /kkjk 3 ds v/khu LFkkfir dqVaqc U;k;ky; fo|eku gS]
,slk dqVaqc U;k;ky; vkSj fdlh ,sls {ks= esa tgka dqVaqc U;k;ky; ugha gS] fdarq
dksbZ  uxj flfoy U;k;ky; fo|eku gS ogka og U;k;ky; vkSj fdlh vU; {ks=
esa] vkjafHkd vf/kdkfjrk j[kus okyk iz/kku flfoy U;k;ky;  vkSj mlds varxZr
,slk dksbZ vU; flfoy U;k;ky; Hkh gS ftls jkT; ljdkj] jkti= esa vf/klwpuk
}kjk] ,sls U;k;ky; ds :i es fofuÆn’V djs ftls ,sls ekeyksa ds laca/k esa
vfèkdkfjrk gS] ftuds ckjs esa bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu dkjZokbZ dh tkrh gS(

¼p½ ßvo;LdÞ ls ,slk O;fDr vfHkizsr gS ftlds ckjs esa o;Ldrk vf/kfu;e] 1875
¼1875 dk 9½ ds mica/kksa ds v/khu ;g ekuk tkrk gS fd mlus] o;Ldrk izkIr
ugha dh gSA



3- cky&fookgksa dk] ca/ku esa vkus okys i{kdkj ds] tks ckyd gS] fodYi ij
'kwU;dj.kh; gksuk&

¼1½ izR;sd cky&fookg tks pkgs bl vf/kfu;e ds izkjaHk ds iwoZ ;k i'pkr~ vuq’Bkfir fd;k
x;k gks] fookg ca/ku esaa vkus okys ,sls i{kdkj ds] tks fookg ds le; ckyd Fkk] fodYi ij
“kwU;dj.kh; gksxk%

ijarq fdlh cky&fookg dks vÑrrk dh fMØh }kjk ckfry djus ds fy,] fookg ca/ku esa vkus
okys  ,sls i{kdkj }kjk gh] tks fookg ds le; ckyd Fkk] ftyk U;k;ky; esa vthZ Qkby dh tk
ldsxhA

¼2½ ;fn vthZ Qkby fd, tkus ds le;] vthZnkj vo;Ld gS rks vthZ mlds lja{kd ;k
okn&fe= ds lkFk&lkFk cky&fookg izfr’ks/k vf/kdkjh dh ekQZr dh tk ldsxhA

¼3½ bl /kkjk ds v/khu vthZ fdlh Hkh le; fdarq vthZ Qkby djus okys ckyd ds
o;Ldrk izkIr djus ds nks o’kZ iwjs djus ls iwoZ Qkby dh tk ldsxhA

¼4½ bl /kkjk ds v/khu vÑrrk dh fMØh iznku djrs le; ftyk U;k;ky;] fookg ds nksuksa
i{kdkjksa vkSj muds ekrk&firk ;k muds laj{kdksa dks ;g funs'k nsrs gq, vkns'k djsxk fd os]
;FkkfLFfr] nwljs i{kdkj] mlds ekrk&firk ;k laj{kd dks fookg ds volj ij mldks nwljs i{kdkj
ls izkIr /ku] ewY;oku oLrq,a] vkHkw’k.k vkSj vU; migkj ;k ,slh ewY;oku oLrqvksa] vkHkw’k.kksa] vU;
migkjksa ds ewY; ds cjkcj jde vkSj /ku ykSVk ns%

ijarq bl /kkjk ds v/khu dksbZ vkns'k rc rd ikfjr ugha fd;k tk,xk tc rd fd lac)
i{kdkjksa dks ftyk U;k;ky; ds le{k mifLFkr gksus vkSj ;g dkj.k nÆ'kr djus ds fy, fd ,slk
vkns'k D;ksa ugha ikfjr fd;k tk,] lwpuk,a u ns nh xbZ gksaA

Hkkjrh; fØf”p;u fookg vf/kfu;e] 1872

60- Hkkjrh; fØf'p;uksa ds fookgksa dks izHkkfor djus dh 'krsZa-&izek.ki= ds fy,

vkosnu djus okys ¼Hkkjrh;½ fØf”p;uksa ds chp izR;sd fookg] /kkjk 3 ds v/khu visf{kr izkjfEHkd



lwpuk ds fcuk] bl Hkkx ds v/khu ml n”kk esa izekf.kr fd;k tk,xk tc fuEufyfy[kr “krsZa iwjh gksrh
gksa] u fd vU;Fkk%&

¼1½ fookg dk vk”k; j[kus okys iq#’k dh vk;q bDdhl o’kZ ls de ugha gksxh vkSj fookg
dk vk”k; j[kus okyh L=h dh vk;q vBkjg o’kZ ls de ugha gksxh%

Ikkjlh fookg vkSj fookg&foPNsn vf/kfu;e] 1936

3- ikjlh fookgksa dh fof/kekU;rk ds ckjs esa vis{kk,a-&¼1½ dksbZ Hkh fookg
fofèkekU; ugha gksxk] ;fn

¼x½ fdlh ,sls ikjlh dh n”kk esa  ¼pkgs ,sls ikjlh us viuk /keZ ;k vf/kokl cnyk gks
;k ugha½ ftlus] ;fn og iq#’k gS rks] bDdhl o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ugha dh gS] vkSj ;fn og efgyk gS
rks] vBkjg o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ugha dh gSA

&&&&&&&&

f}rh; vuqlwph
¼/kkjk 6 nsf[k,½

fookg dk izek.ki=

fookg dh rkjh[k rFkk LFkkuA

ifr rFkk iRuh ds ukeA

fookg ds le; dh fLFkfrA

jSad ;k o`fRrA

vk;qA

fuoklA

firk ;k laj{kd ds ukeA

jSad ;k o`fRrA

fookg djkus okys iqjksfgr ds gLrk{kjA

;fn fookg ds i{kdkj 21 o’kZ ls de vk;q ds gSa rks

muds firk ;k laj{kd ds gLrk{kjA

Lkf{k;ksa ds gLrk{kjA



fo”ks’k fookg vf/kfu;e] 1954

4- fo'ks"k fookgksa ds vuq"Bkiu laca/kh 'krsZa-&foogksa ds vuq’Bkiu lEcU/kh fdlh vU;
rrle; izo`Rr fof/k  esa fdlh ckr ds gksrs gq, Hkh] fdUgha nks O;fDr;ksa dk bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu
fookg vuq’Bkfir fd;k tk ldsxk ;fn ml fookg ds le; fuEufyf[kr “krsZa iwjh gks tkrh gSa]
vFkkZr~%&

¼x½  iq#’k us bDdhl o’kZ dh vk;q vkSj L=h us vBkjg o’kZ dh vk;q izkIr dj yh gS(

fgUnw fookg vf/kfu;e] 1955

5- fgUnw fookg ds fy, 'krsZa-&nks fgUnwvksa ds chp fookg vuq’Bkfir fd;k tk ldsxk
;fn fuEufyf[kr “krsZa iwjh gks tk,a vFkkZr~%&

(iii) fookg ds le; oj us bDdhl o’kZ dh vk;q vkSj o/kw us vBkjg o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh
dj yh gks]

13- fookg&foPNsn-&

¼2½  iRuh fookg&foPNsn dh fMØh n~okjk vius fookg ds fo?kVu ds fy, bl vk/kkj ij Hkh
vthZ miLFkkfir dj ldsxh&

¼iv½  fd mldk fookg ¼pkgs fookgksRrj laHkksx gqvk gks ;k ugha½ mldks iUnzg o’kZ dh vk;q
gks tkus ds iwoZ vuq"Bkfir fd;k x;k Fkk vkSj mlus iUnzg o’kZ dh vk;q izkIr djus ds
i”pkr fdUrq vBkjg o’kZ dh vk;q izkIr djus ds iwoZ fookg dk fujkdj.k dj fn;k gSA



AUTHORITATIVE  ENGLISH  TEXT

                                        BILL NO. 4 OF 2024

     THE  PROHIBITION  OF  CHILD  MARRIAGE  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH
AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2024

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)



THE  PROHIBITION  OF  CHILD  MARRIAGE  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH
AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2024

 ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES

Clauses:

1. Short title, application and commencement.
2. Amendment of section 2.
3. Amendment of section 3.
4. Insertion of section 18A.
5. Amendment of certain enactments.



BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in
the Seventy-fifth year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Prohibition of Child Marriage
(Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2024.

(2) It shall apply to all persons domiciled in the territory of the
State of Himachal Pradesh notwithstanding anything contrary or inconsistent
therewith contained in the Indian Christian Marriage Act, 1872; the Parsi
Marriage and Divorce Act, 1936; the Muslim Personal Law (Shariat)
Application Act, 1937, the Special Marriage Act, 1954; the Hindu Marriage
Act, 1955; or any other law or custom or usage or practice in relation to
marriage, under any other law for the time being in force.

(3) This section, clause (ii) of section 2 and section 4 shall come
into force immediately and the remaining provisions shall come into force on
the date of completion of two years from the date of its enactment and any
reference in any such provision to the commencement of this Act shall be
construed as a reference to the coming into force of that provision.

2. In section 2 of the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006
(hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),-

(i) for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(a) “child” means a male or female who has not
completed twenty-one years of age;”; and

Bill No. 4 of  2024

THE  PROHIBITION  OF  CHILD  MARRIAGE  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH
AMENDMENT) BILL,  2024

                                                                   A

    BILL

to amend the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No. 6
of  2007) in its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh.

Short title,
application
and
commence-
ment.

Amendment
of section 2.

15 of 1872

3 of 1936

26 of 1937

43 of 1954
25 of 1955

5

15

20



(ii) in clause (b), after the words “is a child”, the words
“notwithstanding anything to the contrary or inconsistent
therewith contained in any other law for the time being in
force, including any custom or usage or practice governing
the parties” shall be inserted.

3. In section 3 of the principle Act, in sub-section (3), for the
words “two years”, the words “five years” shall be substituted.

4. After section 18 of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely:-

“18A. Act to have overriding effect.- The provisions of this
Act shall have effect, notwithstanding anything contrary or
inconsistent therewith contained in any other law for the time
being in force, including any custom or usage or practice
governing the parties.”.

5. The enactments specified in THE SCHEDULE shall be
amended in the manner mentioned therein.

Amendment
of section 3.

Insertion of
section 18A.

Amendment
of certain
enactments.

5

10

15

2



THE SCHEDULE
(See section 5)

SI. No. Year Act No. Short title   Amendments
¼1½ ¼2½ ¼3½ ¼4½ ¼5½

In section 60, for clause (1), the following
clause shall be  substituted, namely:-

“(1) the age of the man and woman
intending to be married shall not
be under twenty-one years;”.

(a) in section 3, in sub-section (1),  in
clause (c),  for the words    “female,
has not completed eighteen years
of age”, the words “female, has not
completed twenty-one years of
age” shall be substituted.

(b) in Schedule II, the expression
“Signatures of the fathers or
guardians of the contracting parties
under 21 years of age” shall be
omitted.

In section 4, in clause (c), for the
words “eighteen years”, the words
“twenty-one years” shall be substituted.

(a) in section 5, in clause (iii), for the
words “eighteen years”, the words
“twenty-one years” shall be
substituted.

(b) in section 13,in sub-section (2), in
clause (iv), for the words “eighteen
years”, the words “twenty-one
years” shall be substituted.

1. 1872 15 The Indian
Christian Marriage
Act, 1872

2. 1936 3 The Parsi Marriage
and Divorce Act,
1936

3. 1954 43 The Special
Marriage Act,
1954

4. 1955 25 The Hindu
Marriage
Act, 1955

3



STATEMENT OF OBJECT AND REASONS

The Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 was enacted to provide for the prohibition of
solemnisation of child marriages and for matters connected therewith or incidental thereto. In
today’s world the women are progressing in every field. The early marriages, however, act as a
hindrance not only in the progress of their career but also in their physical development. In order to
provide for gender equality and opportunities of obtaining higher education, it has become necessary
to increase the minimum age of marriage for the girls. Thus, it is proposed to amend the Prohibition
of Child Marriage Act, 2006  and other related Acts in their application to the State of Himachal
Pradesh and increase the minimum age for marriage for girls to 21 years.

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(DR. (COL.) DHANI RAM SHANDIL)
Minister-in-charge.

SHIMLA:
The……………..2024.

__________

FINANCIAL  MEMORANDUM

— Nil—

__________

MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION

— Nil—

 _______



THE PROHIBITION OF CHILD MARRIAGE (HIMACHAL PRADESH
AMENDMENT) BILL, 2024

 A

 BILL

   to amend the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No. 6 of  2007) in its
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh.

 (DR. (COL.) DHANI RAM SHANDIL)
Minister-in-Charge.

_______________

(SHARAD  KUMAR  LAGWAL)
                              Secretary (Law).

SHIMLA:
The                 , 2024



EXTRACT OF THE PROVISIONS OF THE ACTS  LIKELY TO BE AFFECTED
BY THIS AMENDMENT BILL

THE PROHIBITION OF CHILD MARRIAGE ACT, 2006

2. Definitions.—In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,—

(a) “child” means a person who, if a male, has not completed twenty-one years of
age, and if a female, has not completed eighteen years of age;

(b) “child marriage” means a marriage to which either of the contracting parties is a
child;

 (c) “contracting party”, in relation to a marriage, means either of the parties whose
marriage is or is about to be thereby solemnised;

(d) “Child Marriage Prohibition Officer” includes the Child Marriage Prohibition
Officer appointed under sub-section (1) of section 16;

(e) “district court” means, in any area for which a Family Court established under
section 3 of the Family Courts Act, 1984 (66 of 1984) exists, such Family
Court, and in any area for which there is no Family Court but a city civil court
exists, that court and in any other area, the principal civil court of original
jurisdiction and includes any other civil court which may be specified by the
State Government, by notification in the Official Gazette, as having jurisdiction
in respect of the matters dealt with in this Act;

(f) “minor” means a person who, under the provisions of the Majority Act, 1875
(9 of 1875), is to be deemed not to have attained his majority.

3. Child marriages to be voidable at the option of contracting party being a
child.—(1) Every child marriage, whether solemnised before or after the commencement of this
Act, shall be voidable at the option of the contracting party who was a child at the time of the
marriage:

Provided that a petition for annulling a child marriage by a decree of nullity may be filed in
the district court only by a contracting party to the marriage who was a child at the time of the
marriage.



(2) If at the time of filing a petition, the petitioner is a minor, the petition may be filed
through his or her guardian or next friend along with the Child Marriage Prohibition Officer.

(3) The petition under this section may be filed at any time but before the child filing the
petition completes two years of attaining majority.

(4) While granting a decree of nullity under this section, the district court shall make an
order directing both the parties to the marriage and their parents or their guardians to return to the
other party, his or her parents or guardian, as the case may be, the money, valuables, ornaments
and other gifts received on the occasion of the marriage by them from the other side, or an amount
equal to the value of such valuables, ornaments, other gifts and money:

Provided that no order under this section shall be passed unless the concerned parties
have been given notices to appear before the district court and show cause why such order should
not be passed.

_________

THE INDIAN CHRISTIAN MARRIAGE ACT, 1872

60. On what conditions marriages of  Indian Christians may be certified.—Every
marriage between  Indian Christians applying for a certificate, shall, without the preliminary notice
required under Part III, be certified under this Part, if the following conditions be fulfilled, and not
otherwise:—

(1) the age of the man intending to be a married  shall not be under  twenty-one
years, and the age of the woman intending to be married  shall not be under  eighteen years;

_________

THE  PARSI  MARRIAGE  AND  DIVORCE  ACT, 1936

3. Requisites to validity of Parsi marriages.—(1) No marriage shall be valid if—

(c) in the case of any Parsi (whether such Parsi has changed his or her religion or
domicile or not) who, if a male, has not completed twenty-one years of age,
and if a female, has not completed eighteen years of age.



SCHEDULE II
(See section 6)

Certificate of Marriage

Date and place of marriage.

Names of the husband and wife.

Condition at the time of marriage.

Rank or profession.

Age.

Residence.

Names of the fathers or guardians.

Rank or profession.

Signature of the officiating priest.

Signatures of the contracting parties.

Signatures of the fathers or guardians of the
contracting parties under 21 years of age.

Signatures of Witnesses.

THE SPECIAL MARRIAGE ACT, 1954

4. Conditions relating to solemnization of special marriages.¯Notwithstanding
anything contained in any other law for the time being in force relating to the solemnization of
marriages, a marriage between any two persons may be solemnized under this Act, if at the time of
the marriage the following conditions are fulfilled, namely:¯

(c) the male has completed the age of twenty-one years and the female the age of
eighteen years;



THE HINDU MARRIAGE ACT, 1955

5. Conditions for a Hindu marriage.—A marriage may be solemnized between any
two Hindus, if the following conditions are fulfilled, namely:—

(iii) the bridegroom has completed the age of  twenty-one years and the bride, the
age of  eighteen years at the time of the marriage;

13. Divorce.—

(2) A wife may also present a petition for the dissolution of her marriage by a
decree of divorce on the ground,—

(iv) that her marriage (whether consummated or not) was solemnized before she
attained the age of fifteen years and she has repudiated the marriage after attaining
that age but before attaining the age of eighteen years.

jktdh; eqnz.kky;] fg0 iz0] f'keyk&&2477&tqM@2024&22&2&2024&&175-


